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Fran Drescher

Francine Joy Drescher (born September 30, 1957) is an American actress and trade unionist. She is currently
serving as the national president of the Screen...

Drescher

Drescher (/?dr???r/ DRESH-?r, German: [?d????]; Yiddish: ?????? [?dr???r]) is a surname. Notable people
with the surname include: Bill Drescher (1921–1968)...

The Nanny (category Television series created by Fran Drescher)

originally aired on CBS from November 3, 1993, to June 23, 1999, starring Fran Drescher as Fran Fine, a
Jewish fashionista from Flushing, Queens, who becomes the...

Peter Marc Jacobson

then-wife, Fran Drescher, who also starred in the series. He was often credited as Peter Marc in his early
acting roles. Jacobson and Fran Drescher married in...

The Fran Drescher Show

The Fran Drescher Show (also called The Fran Drescher Tawk Show) is an American talk show hosted by
actress Fran Drescher. The series premiered on November...

The Real Housewives of New York City (redirect from Aviva Drescher)

announced a revamp to the cast for its fifth season, integrating Aviva Drescher, Carole Radziwill, and
Heather Thomson into the main cast. The season premiered...

The Beautician and the Beast

film directed by Ken Kwapis, written by Todd Graff, and starring Fran Drescher, Timothy Dalton, Lisa
Jakub, Ian McNeice, and Patrick Malahide. It tells...

Spinal Tap II: The End Continues

Harry Shearer as Derek Smalls Rob Reiner as Martin &quot;Marty&quot; Di Bergi Fran Drescher as Bobbi
Flekman Don Lake John Michael Higgins Jason Acuña Nina Conti Griffin...

The Nanny season 1

November 3, 1993, to May 16, 1994. The series was created by actress Fran Drescher and her then-husband
Peter Marc Jacobson, and developed by Prudence Fraser...

James Drescher



James Drescher (born August 12, 1965), better known as Jimmy Gestapo or Jimmy Spliff, is the lead singer
for New York based hardcore punk band Murphy&#039;s...

Gary Drescher

Gary L. Drescher is a scientist in the field of artificial intelligence (AI), and author of multiple books on AI,
including Made-Up Minds: A Constructivist...

The Nanny Reunion: A Nosh to Remember

was said by Drescher to have gotten &quot;lost&quot;. At the end of the special, &quot;Danny&quot;
(actually Danny Bonaduce), makes an appearance. Fran Drescher Renée Taylor...

Jack Drescher

Jack Drescher (born 1951) is an American psychiatrist and psychoanalyst known for his work on sexual
orientation and gender identity. Drescher earned...

Shiva Ayyadurai

connected with actress Fran Drescher. On September 7, 2014, Ayyadurai and Drescher participated in a
ceremony at Drescher&#039;s beach house. Both tweeted that...

Charles Shaughnessy

Sheffield opposite Fran Drescher on CBS&#039;s The Nanny from 1993 to 1999. He and Drescher resumed
acting together in Drescher&#039;s next sitcom, Living with...

Seymour Drescher

Seymour Drescher (born 1934) is an American historian and a professor at the University of Pittsburgh,
known for his studies on Alexis de Tocqueville and...

Marty Supreme

the Creator Odessa A&#039;zion Penn Jillette Kevin O&#039;Leary Abel Ferrara Fran Drescher as Mrs.
Mauser, Marty&#039;s mother Sandra Bernhard Spenser Granese Philippe...

Carl Wilhelm Drescher

Carl (or Karl) Wilhelm Drescher (12 December 1850 – 8 December 1925) was an Austrian violinist and
composer. In Vienna he founded and led a successful...

The Nanny season 4

September 18, 1996, to May 21, 1997. The series was created by actress Fran Drescher and her-then husband
Peter Marc Jacobson, and developed by Prudence Fraser...

The Nanny season 6
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September 30, 1998, to June 23, 1999. The series was created by actress Fran Drescher and her-then husband
Peter Marc Jacobson, and developed by Prudence Fraser...
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